TR &, 9.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Y.5H.-8).0eT.-37.-23102020-22266 1
CG-DL-E-23102020-222661

T
EXTRAORDINARY
AT II—Evs 3—39-Tvs (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 3325 TS faeett, geeafaaTy, STy 22, 2020/5fRaT 30, 1942
No. 3325] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, OCTOBER 22, 2020/ASVINA 30, 1942
TITET, T SR AT TRAAT HATAT

=T

< faeett, 20 @Y, 2020

P13 3752(31) — DR WRPR, Tchleid JATGRT IR a9 HATed, GATEaRoT (WRefon) iferfam,

1986 ®I TRT (3) BT IYLRT (1) 3R YR (2) & e (V) B 39 DI Uacd AfddAl BT YART B
8 Tchlele YITaROT 3R a9 HATed H el & Yad ‘P & A o arel fAawdl & oy ey
TRBR H GITEROT IR 99 AT ¥ 3R IId ATGAT & Fav @' & (A 3 arel fawai & forg s
TR W, AT YATRT FATH HEROT YISO A Yd UATARON Ul ATSMYS g7 8T B3
1533(31) IR 14 RAdaR, 2006 & ERT GAERVY FATATG HeIRoT ORI, 2006 (SHH SHS ULA S
31 T AT, 2006 FHET AT 2) UHIRIG fHam 2;

3R gafaRoT (AReTon) IIfAfEH, 1986 @1 €RT 3 @I SUURT (3) @ ATHd DU ARBR RT I
qyfqRoer ETETd fReiRer wifeRer iR oy wR vy efiderd wfafaat wfed @ S fadr i ad
& fad e e erfr|

IR TRV, 991 3R Sierary uRadd #Aed &l Ul W ywdEl & Siad vl & e
ER & oI ASMRT BIfde 19 ST Bidud Rt § 57 gafaRer FH7erd FeiRor giidesor iR ey
R faRivg arider AfAfol &1 N9 af & gwarq S oE & AR & fou snarde o v E;

IR, DI APHR Aarad gRRfET # Higer o9 gafaRer FAEma HeiRer uieRer sk
g WR fIRE s ARl & @y # IR &1 Jiaeasd |l &

AT M, BRI WRBR, UIiaRer (Hxeqon) g9, 1986 & 99 5 & Sufe™ (4) & A ufed
TR (RET0T) SNSRI, 1986 (1986 BT 29) BT &RT 3 B SU—RT (1) 3R SUERT (2) & s (V) g
U Wfdaal &1 TN dRd gY, A f’d H, Saa el & w5 @ Sufiem (3) @ g (@) & i

5116 GI1/2020 (1)




L 10 UAZER L 1B U INDIA [ EALTKRAURKDINAKY [ FART LI—DEC. 3(11)]

AT BT AU W AWGAT B TR, $H § ATy Y IMEFGA, 2006 H FEAfRET IR HREH AT g,
gt —

I AT H—

(i) U7 3 ¥, JU-URT (6) W, WD H, TGl H B8 He' & WM W, "IRE Fel W& I G |

(i) U5 H IU-URT (M) H, WP ¥, T H "B AEM b WM W, RS A e W S |

(i) uRRme VIH A5 7 § wge # o § "Bg 7EM’ & WM R, "dRg A I Y S0 |
[1. 7. SI—11013 / 30 / 2007 33 T— lI(1)]

3Rfde HAR Afedre], Wy afed

feoqoT: Ao SIfeRgET wRA & Ioud, IR, 91T |, @vs 3, IU @ue (i) # Pram 1533 (31) IR
14 AR, 2006 ERT UHIRG @1 TS off 3R qULA] ARG 15 ITAAR, 2020 B B3I 3636 (31) NI
39 3ifom IR denfda far ar e

MINISTRY OF ENVIRONMENT, FOREST AND CLIMATE CHANGE

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 20th October, 2020

S.0. 3752(E).—WHEREAS, the Central Government in the erstwhile Ministry of Environment
and Forests, in exercise of its powers under sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section (2) of section (3)
of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 has published the Environment Impact Assessment Notification,
2006 (hereinafter referred to as the said notification) vide number S.0.1533 (E), dated the 14th September,
2006, mandating prior Environmental Clearance from the Central Government in the Ministry of
Environment and Forests for matters falling under Category ‘A’ in the Schedule and at State level the State
Environment Impact Assessment Authority for matters falling under Category ‘B’ in the said Schedule;

AND WHEREAS, the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert
Appraisal Committees shall be constituted by the Central Government under sub-section (3) of section 3 of
the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 for a fixed term of three years;

AND WHEREAS, the Ministry of Environment, Forest and Climate Change is in the receipt of
representations for extension of tenure of the State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State
Level Expert Appraisal Committees, beyond three years in certain situation like pandemic COVID 19, for
uninterrupted dealing the matters under Category “B” proposals;

AND WHEREAS, the Central Government deems it necessary to extend the tenure of the existing

State Environment Impact Assessment Authority and State Level Expert Appraisal Committees, in
exceptional circumstances;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) and clause (v) of sub-section
(2) of section 3 of the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986), read with sub-rule (4) of rule 5 of
the Environment (Protection) Rules, 1986, the Central Government after having dispensed with the
requirement of notice under clause (a) of sub-rule (3) of rule 5 of the said rules, in public interest, hereby
makes the following further amendments in the EIA Notification, 2006, namely:-

In the said notification, -

(i) in paragraph 3, in sub-paragraph (6), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted.



LHUY 11—9vs 3(11)] HILA Dl XSTHA A AW J

(ii) in paragraph 5, in sub-paragraph (c), in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted.

(iii) in the APPENDIX VI, in item 7, in the proviso, for the words “six months”, the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted.

[F. No. J-11013/30/2007-IA. TI(I)]
ARVIND KUMAR NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II,
Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S.O. 1533 (E), dated the 14th September, 2006 and was last
amended vide notification number S.O. 3636(E), dated the 15th October, 2020.

CIBE I
e faeett, 22 srrqE, 2020

P1. AT 3753(31) — D<= IRBR & TITGRUT (A1) IIfATTH 1986 (1986 HT 29) @I €RT 3 &I
IU-GRT (3) gRT Y& WAfAddl & TINT HRd gY 3R AR IRER & dchlel, JATER R a5 FA1erd
DI AL HRIT BT 1533(31) TRIG 14 AT, 2006 & ATERVT H, YRA & STUS, SJERIRYT, AN
ll, Tog 3, IU WS (i) § ARG 17 HE, 2017 & BILAL 850(31) ERT UHIRIG UAERYT, 99 3R STdryg
IRE AT, IR IR DI ARG H FrforRad demee o=l &, 1id:

I AfergaT #,

0) IRT 2 & H, 3fd, MR AR g 16 RITRR 2020" & WMH W 3idh, MeR AR g 16 A 2021
T Y USSR & o9 db, AERTSE, S A1 Ugel 8 I e |

(ii) IRT 8 & H, 3id, R AR g 16 RIAWR 2020 & R W 3d, 3eR AR e 16 AT 2021
I Y 5T WY [IRws fidhed Affal, AeRTE @& T84 d@ Sff 9 Ul a7 & S |

[*7. . S—11013 /30 / 2007.3M$5— 1I(1)]

3Rfde Aifeareagad dfd

feoqoT: ot ORI WIRA & JISIU=, IR, 9T I, @vs 3, IU @Ue (i) § 1.7, 850 (37) TRIG 17
AT, 2017 RT USRI @1 T8 o 3R dUvdrd ARG 12 AT, 2017 & BT 4040 (31) TAUT ARG 8
S, 2020 & BIAT. 1788(31) ERT $H WA fowam T o7 |

WEIHRS AU 16 T, 20217 & T § “16 dr, 2021" BT GlaRMfid e N1 2% IR T 86 &
HEE PR, fdT W @fdd & 8 WR uldanet U1a T8l U |

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd October, 2020

S.0. 3753(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Environment
(Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986) and in pursuance of the notification of the Government of India in the erstwhile
Ministry of Environment and Forests, number S.O. 1533(E), dated the 14th September, 2006, the Central Government
hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of
Environment, Forest and Climate Change, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-
section (i), vide number S.O. 850(E), dated the 17th March, 2017, namely:-



“+ 10 UAZER L 1B U INDIA [ EALTKRAURKDINAKY [ FART LI—DEC. 3(11)]

In the said notification, -

(1) in paragraph 2A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 20207, the figures, letters and word “16th
March, 2021 or till the constitution of new Authority, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be
substituted.

(i1) in paragraph 8A, for the figures, letters and word “16th September, 20207, the figures, letters and word “16th
March, 2021 or till the constitution of new SEACs, Maharashtra, whichever is earlier.”, shall be substituted.

[F.No. J-11013/30/2007-1A.1(I)]

ARVIND NAUTIYAL, Jt. Secy.

Note:- The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section
(i1), vide number S.0. 850 (E), dated the 17th March, 2017 and subsequently amended vide number S.O. 4040(E),
dated the 12th December, 2017 and vide number S.O. 1788(E), dated the 8th June, 2020.

Explanatory Memorandum: By making amendments in paragraph 2A and paragraph 8A by substituting “16th
September, 2020 as the “16th March, 20217, the interest of no person shall be adversely affected.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



